BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL
ROAD TRAFFIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTON & HOVE
VARIOUS CONTROLLED PARKING ZONES CONSOLIDATION
ORDER 2008 AMENDMENT ORDER NO.13 2009

Brighton & Hove City Council (hereinafter referred to as "the Council”), in exercise
of their powers under Sections |, 2, 3, 4, 19, 32, 35, 35A, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47, 49, 51,
53, 55, 61, 63, 63A, 66, 117 and 124 (1) (c) & (d) to the Road Traffic Regulation Act
1984 ("the Act") as amended and by Part 6 of the Traffic Management Act 2004
(“the 2004 Act”) and of all other enabling powers hereby make the following Order:-

The provisions of the above named Order will come into force on the 16"
November 2009 and amend the Brighton & Hove Various Controlled Parking Zones
Consolidation Order 2008 (“the 2008 Order™) as follows:-

Article Amendments:

PART | - GENERAL

Article 3 For the expression “Resident” replace the existing wording of “(b)”
with the following:
“no Resident’s Permit can be obtained in respect of those premises and/or
lengths of road identified as being excluded from eligibility in column 3 and
described as “Car Free” in column (4) of Schedule | Part 18 for each of
the Controlled Parking Zones identified therein unless the applicant is also
the holder of a valid Disabled Person’s Badge.”

PART 3 - PARKING PLACES
Article | (6) (a) Delete “Parts 9.1 and 9.2” and insert “Parts 9.1, 9.2 and 9.5"

PART 10 - INDEX OF SCHEDULE |

Part I No Waiting Restrictions

Part 1.3 Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm: add the letter “Y” in the column headed
"CPZL’s” ’

Part 1.4 Monday to Saturday 9am to 6pm: add the letter “Q” in the column headed
"CPZL’s”

Part 5 Add “Shared” before “Permit or Pay & Display Parking Places”
Part 6 Add “Exclusive’ before “Pay & Display Parking Places”
Part 7 Doctors Parking Places

Part 7.1 At Any Time: add the letter “Z” in the column headed "CPZ’s”
Part 7.2 8am to 8pm on any day: add the letter “N” in the column headed "CPZ’s”



Part 8 Car Club Parking Places

Part 8.1 At Any Time (City Car Club): add the letter “O” in the column headed
"CPZ’s”

Part 8.3 At Any Time (Streetcar): add the letters “C”, “N” and “Y” in the column
headed "CPZ’s”

Part 12 Loading Bays
Part 124 Mon - Sun 9am to 8pm | hour no return within 30 minutes: add the letter
“N” in the column headed “CPZ’s”

Add new Part “12.11 Mon - Sun 9am to 6pm” and the letter “Z” in the column
headed "CPZ’s”

Add new Part “12.12 Mon - Sun 8am to 6pm” and the letter “N” in the column
headed "CPZ’s”

Schedule | Amendments:
For each of the Controlled Parking Zones identified below Parts to Schedule | of the
2008 Order will be amended as follows:

Zone C

Part I.1 No Waiting At Any Time
Amend ltems 71, 72, 73 and 86: delete “St James” and substitute *“St James’s”

Part 5.3 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from
Monday to Saturday between 9am and 8pm inclusive .-

Amend Item |2 Veronica Way delete "west of the western kerbline and substitute
“east of the eastern kerbline” and delete “westwards” and substitute “eastwards”

Part 5.13 Shared Permit Holders and Medium Tariff Short Term Pay &
Display parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours)
from Monday to Saturday between 9am and 8pm inclusive

Add Item 7a: Ivory Place - east side - from a point 6 metres north of the northern
kerbline of Morley Street, northwards for a distance of 21.5 metres - (CPZ) “C”

Part 6.3 Exclusive Medium Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for a
period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to
Saturday between 9am and 6pm inclusive

Delete Item 5 Ivory Place

Part 8.1 — City Car Club only At Any Time
Add Item 2: Wyndham Street - west side - from a point 8 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Upper St James’s Street southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres

- (CPZ) HCH



Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club only At Any Time

Add Item |: Devonshire Place — east side - from a point 9 metres north of the
northern kerbline of St James’s Street northwards for a distance of 5 metres. Permit
No.3-009

Part 9.1- Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add Item 2la: Ivory Place — east side - from a point opposite the southern boundary
of No.6 Ivory Place southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ) “C”

© Add Item 38a: St George’s Terrace — north side - from a point 42.1 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Upper Bedford Street eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres
- (CPZ) “C”

Part I I.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Delete existing Iltem 2 Atlingworth Street

Add new ltem 2: Atlingworth Street — east side - from a point 6 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Marine Parade northwards for a distance of 3 metres - (CPZ)
l‘C”

Delete existing Item 60 West Drive

Add new [tem 60: West Drive — south side - from a point 6 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of the Private Road (adjacent to 1-18 Park View) eastwards for a

distance of 3metres - (CPZ) “C”

Part [4.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Renumber existing Item | Park Street as Item 2

Renumber existing Item 2 Somerset Street as ltem 3

Renumber existing ltem 3 Somerset.Street as ltem 4

Add new Item I: High Street — west side - from a point 26.5 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Ardingly Street northwards for a distance of 11.1 metres —
(CPZ) “C)’

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permit

Amend Item 53 Lower Rock Gardens: in column (3) insert “Flats | and 2 8A” before

“No. 69”. In column (4) before “No.69 -Car Free” insert Flats | and 2 8A”

Amend ltem 58 Marine Parade: in column (3) insert “excluding Flats | to 6 No.69”
after “Nos. 1-89 only”. In column (4) insert “Flats | to 6 No.69 — Car Free”

Amend ltems 90, 91, 92 and 108: delete “St James” and substitute “St James’s”



Zone H

Part 9.1- Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend ltem 8 Beresford Road: delete “kerbline of Beresford Road” and substitute
“kerbline of Donald Hall Road” and delete *“13.2 metres” and substitute “6.6 metres”

Amend Item 9 Beresford Road: delete “95.5 metres” and substitute “102.1 metres”
and delete “12.] metres” and substitute “6.6 metres”

Add Item 28a: College Terrace — North side - from a point 6 metres west of the

western kerbline of Walpole Terrace westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres —
(CPZ) “H”

Amend ltem 38 Eastern Terrace: delete “51.8 metres” and substitute “58.1 metres”

Add Item 52a: Sussex Square — North Side - from a point 5.4 metres east of the
boundary wall between Nos. 22 & 23 Sussex Square eastwards for a distance of 2.7
metres (I bay at an angle of 90 degrees to the kerb) — (CPZ) “C”

Part 11.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time _

Add ltem 5a: Chadborn Close — West side - from a point 82 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Donald Hall Road southwards for a distance of 3 metres —
(CPZ) “C”

Amend Item 9 College Road: (Side of Road) delete “East” and substitute “West”
Amend ltem 10 Crescent Place: delete “6.7 metres” and substitute “9.3 metres”

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permit

Amend ltem 63 Sussex Square: in column (3) insert “Excluding Flats | to 4 No.22,
and Nos. 22A and 22B. In column (4) insert “Flats | to 4 No.22, and Nos. 22A and
22B -"Car Free” e

Zone M

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Parking and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay and
Display parking ( for a period of up to 4 hours no return within 4 hours)
from Monday to Sunday between 9am and 8pm inclusive

Delete Item 16 Lansdowne Place

Add ltem 16: Lansdowne Place - East side - 60° Echelon Parking. From a point 15.5
metres north of the northern kerbline of Brunswick Terrace northwards for a
distance of 14.1 metres - (CPZ) “M”

Add ltem 16: Lansdowne Place- East side - 60° Echelon Parking. From a point 32.3
metres north of the northern kerbline of Brunswick Terrace northwards for a

distance 10.8 metres - (CPZ) “M”

Delete Item 22 Lansdowne Road



Part 6.1 Exclusive Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for a
period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to
Saturday between 9am and épm inclusive

Amend ltem 2 Brunswick Road: delete “Nos. 54 and 56” and substitute “Nos. 54 and
55”

Part 8.1- City Car Club only At Any Time
Renumber existing ltem 2 Waterloo Street as ltem 3

Add Item 2: Lansdowne Place - East side - 60° Echelon Parking. From a point 29.7
metres north of the northern kerbline of Brunswick Terrace northwards for a
distance of 2.5 metres - (CPZ) “M”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend ltem 12 Brunswick Street West: delete “29.4 metres” insert “28.8 metres”

Amend ltem |5 Farm Road: delete “10 metres” insert “13.5 metres”

Add ltem |9a: Lansdowne Place — West side from a point 16.8 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Western Road southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ)
l‘M”

Amend Item 21 Lansdowne Square: delete “20.9 metres” insert “22.9 metres”
Amend ltem 35 York Road: delete “26.3 metres” insert “27.6 metres”

Part 11.] Motorcycles only At Any Time
Amend ltem 20 Lansdowne Place: delete “6 metres” and substitute “12.5 metres”

Zone N

Part 1.1 No Waiting At Any Time
Add Item 40a: Hove Street South — Both sides - Whole length - (CPZ) “N”

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am -8pm
inclusive

Amend Item 4 Brooker Street: delete “to a point 4.3 metres north of the southern
boundary of No 24 Brooker Street” and substitute “northwards for a distance of 10
metres”

Add Item 4a: Brooker Street — East side - from a point 24.5 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Stirling Place northwards for a distance of 17 metres - (CPZ)
&LN’)

Add Item 4b: Brooker Street — East side - from a point 48 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Stirling Place northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres - (CPZ)
‘lN)’



Add Item 4c: Brooker Street — East side - from a point 59 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Stirling Place northwards for a distance of 55.8 metres - (CPZ)
‘lN”

Amend ltem 27 Goldstone Villas: insert “east and west” after “centre” and before
“parking”

Amend ltem 39 Hova Villas: delete “No.9 Hova Villas” and substitute “No.10 Hova
Villas”

Amend ltem 91 Tisbury Road: delete “4.3metres north of the party wall of nos. 16
and 18 Tisbury Road and insert “83.7 metres north of the northern of Church Road
to”

Part 5.7 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 11 hours) from Monday to Sunday between
9am -8pm inclusive

Delete Item 14 Goldstone Street

Delete ltem 15 Goldstone Street

Part 5.11 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay &
Display parking (for a period of up to 9 hours) Monday to Friday between
9am to 6pm inclusive

Delete Item | Conway Street (east/west)

Delete Item 2 Conway Street (east/west)

Delete Item 3 Conway Street (north/south)

Delete Item 4 Conway Street (north/south)

Delete Item 5 Ellen Street

Delete Item 6 Ellen Street

Delete Item 7 Ethel Street

Delete Item 8 Goldstone Street

Delete Item 9 Goldstone Street

Add new Item |: Conway Street (north/south section) — East side - from a point 13.8
metres north of the northern kerbline of Clarendon Road northwards for a distance
of 22.9 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new Item 2: Conway Street (east/west section) — North side - from a point 14

metres east of the prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Conway Street
(north/south section) eastwards for a distance of 14.2 metres - (CPZ) “N”



Add new Item 3: Conway Street (east/west section) — North side - from a point 46.5
metres east of the prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Conway Street
(north/south section) eastwards for a distance of 33.9 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new Item 3: Conway Street (east/west section) — North side - from a point
109.2 metres east of the prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Conway Street
(north/south section) eastwards for a distance of 22 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new Item 4: Conway Street (east/west section) — North side - from a point 10.6
metres east of the eastern kerbline of Goldstone Street eastwards for a distance of
95.1 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new ltem 5: Conway Street (east/west section) — south side - from a point 10.3
metres west of the western kerbline of Conway Street (north/south section) -
(CPZ) “N”

Add new Item 6: Conway Street (east/west section) — South side - from a point 10.1
metres east of the eastern kerbline of Conway Street (north/south section)
eastwards for a distance of 18.9 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new ltem 7: Conway Street (east/west section) — South side - from a point 57.5
metres east of the eastern kerbline of Conway Street (north/south section)
eastwards for a distance of 10.1 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new ltem 8: Conway Street (east/west section) — South side - from a point 83.2
metres east of the eastern kerbline of Conway Street (north/south section)
eastwards for a distance of 73.4 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new Item 9: Conway Street (east/west section) — South side - from a point 19.9
metres east of the eastern kerbline of Goldstone Street eastwards for a distance of
78.3 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new Item: 10 Ellen Street — North side - from a point 10.3 metres west of the
western kerbline of Ethel Street westwards for a distance of 10 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new ltem | I: Ellen Street — North side - from a point 41.6 metres west of the
western kerbline of Ethel Street westwards for a distance of 3| metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new ltem 12: Ellen Street — North side - from a point 19.6 metres west of the

western kerbline of Goldstone Street westwards for a distance of 14.3 metres -
(CPZ) LLN’)

Add new ltem 13: Ellen Street — North side - from a point 40.8 metres west of the
western kerbline of Goldstone Street westwards for a distance of 15.2 metres -
(CPZ) “N!)

Add new ltem 14: Ellen Street — North side - from a point 21.5 metres west of the
western kerbline of the access between The Agora and Tecore House westwards
for a distance of | 1.2 metres - (CPZ) “N”



Add new Item 15: Ellen Street — North side - from a point 47.3 metres west of the
western kerbline of the access between The Agora and Tecore House westwards
for a distance of 32.8 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new Item |6: Ellen Street — South side - from a point 10.8 metres east of the

eastern kerbline of Conway Street (north/south section) eastwards for a distance of
16 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new Item 17: Ellen Street — South side - from a point 94.6 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Conway Street (north/south section) eastwards for a distance of
15.4 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new Item 18: Ethel Street — West side - from a point 9.8 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Conway Street (east/west section) southwards for a distance of
27.2 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new ltem 19: Ethel Street — West side - from a point 21.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Ellen Street southwards for a distance of 15 metres - (CPZ)
“N,’ -

Add new Item 20: Goldstone Street — East side - from a point |9 metres north of

the northern kerbline of Ellen Street northwards for a distance of 21.2 metres -
(CPZ) “N”

Add new ltem 21: Goldstone Street — West side - from a point 10 metres south of

the southern kerbline of Conway Street (east/west section) southwards for a
distance of | 1.8 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new Item 22: Goldstone Street — West side - from a point 31.6 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Conway Street (east/west section) southwards for a
distance of 1 1.7 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Part 6.1- Exclusive Parking Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking
(for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday to
Saturday between 9am and 6 pm inclusive

Delete Item 9 Church Road

Add new ltem 9: Church Road — North side - from a point 37 metres west of the
western kerbline of Salisbury Road westwards for a distance of 6.1 metres - (CPZ)
‘LN”

Add new ltem 9a: Church Road — North side - from a point 10.7 metres west of the
western kerbline of Wilbury Road westwards for a distance of 16.2 metres - (CPZ)
“NY’

Add new Item 9b: Church Road — North side - from a point 42.9 metres west of the
western kerbline of Wilbury Road westwards for a distance of 33.3 metres - (CPZ)
‘LN),



Add new Item 9c: Church Road — North side - from a point 40.2 metres west of the
western kerbline of Norton Road westwards for a distance of 28.5 metres - (CPZ)
‘LN)’

Add new ltem 9d: Church Road — North side - from a point 10.1 metres west of the
western kerbline of Hova Villas westwards for a distance of 30.3 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Renumber existing Item 9 Connaught Terrace as Item 11
Renumber existing ltem 10 Connaught Terrace as Item 12
Renumber existing Item | | Easton Road as ltem |3
Renumber existing Item 12 Eaton Road as ltem 14
Renumber existing Item |3 Eaton Villas as Item 15
Renumber existing Item 14 Eaton Villas as Item 16
Renumber existing ltem |5 Eaton Villas as Item 17
Renumber existing ltem 16 First Avenue as ltem 18
Renumber existing Item 17 First Avenue as Iltem 19
Renumber existing ltem |8 First Avenue as Item 20
Renumber existing Item 17 First Avenue as Item 21
Renumber existing ltem |8 Fourth Avenue as Item 22
Renumber existing ltem 19 Goldstone Villas as Item 23
Renumber existing Item 20 Goldstone Villas as ltem 24
Renumber existing Item 21 Grand Avenue (Secondary) as Item 25
Renumber existing Item 22 Grand Avenue as ltem 26
Renumber existing Item 23 Haddington Close as Item 27
Renumber existing Item 24 Haddington Close as Item 28
Renumber existing Item 25 Hova Villas as Item 29
Renumber existing Item 26 Hova Villas as Item 30
Renumber existing Item 25 Medina Villas as Item 31

Renumber existing Item 26 Medina Villas as Item 32



Delete Item 27 Monmouth Street

Renumber existing ltem 28 Norton Road as ltem 33
Renumber existing Item 29 Osborne Villas as ltem 34
Renumber existing Item 30 Osborne Villas as Item 35
Renumber existing Item 31 Seafield Road as ltem 36
Renumber existing ltem 32 Seafield Road as Item 37
Renumber existing Item 33 Selbourne Road as Item 38
Renumber existing Item 34 Selbourne Road as ltem 39
Renumber existing ltem 33 The Drive as [tem 40
Renumber existing ltem 34 The Drive as ltem 4|
Renumber existing Item 35 Third Avenue as ltem 42
Renumber existing ltem 36 Tisbury Road as Item 43
Renumber éxisting Item 37 Tisbury Road as Item 44 and amend description: delete
“46.7 metres” and substitute “48.6 metres” and delete “16.5 metres” and substitute
“10.6 metres”.

Renumber existing Item 38 Vallance Road as ltem 45
Renumber existing Item 39 Vallance Road as ltem 46
Renumber existing ltem 40 Ventnor Villas as ltem 47
Renumber existing Item 41 Ventnor Villas as ltem 48
Renumber existing Item 42 Ventnor Villas as Item 49
Renumber existing ltem 41 Ventnor Villas as Item 50
Renumber existing [tem 42 Wilbury Road as ltem 51
Renumber existing Item 43 Wilbury Road as Item 52
Renumber existing ltem 44 Wilbury Road as ltem 53

Part 7.1- Doctors Parking At Any Time
Delete Item 2 Eaton Gardens



Part 7.2 Doctors Parking 8am = 8pm on any day
Add Item |: Eaton Gardens — North side - from a point 9 metres west of the

western kerbline of Eaton Gardens westwards for a distance of |5.8 metres = (CPZ)
L‘NY’

Part 8.1 - City Car Club only At Any Time
Delete Item 4 Tisbury Road

Delete Item 5 Tisbury Road

Add new Item 4: Tisbury Road - west side - from a point 59.2 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Church Road northwards for a distance of 10.3 metres. Permit
Nos. 1-013 & [-045 - (CPZ) “N”

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club only At Any Time
Add new Item I: Station Approach — South side - from a point 9.3 metres east of
the eastern kerbline of Goldstone Villas eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres.

Permit No.3-007

Add new ltem 2: Wilbury Road — West side - from a point 20.6 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Church Road northwards for a distance of 5 metres. Permit
No.3-008

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Renumber existing Item | Blatchington Road as ltem [A

Add Item 1: Albany Villas — West side - from a point 186.6 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Church Road southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ)
tLN”

Delete Item 6 Brooker Street
Delete ltem 12 Clarendon Villas

Add Item I4a: Connaught Road — East side - from the southern boundary wall of
No.3 Connaught Road northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add Item 18a: Cromwell Road - South side - from a point 34.6 metres west of the
western kerbline of Eaton Gardens westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ)
HN’)

Add Item 63a: The Drive — West side - from a point 44.5 metres south of the

southern kerbline of Cromwell Road southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres -
(CPZ) “N”

Add Item 63b: The Drive — West side - from a point 49.9 metres south of the

southern kerbline of Eaton Road southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ)
“N!’



Add ltem 63c: The Drive — East side - from a point 38.2 metres south of the

southern kerbline of Eaton Road southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ)
(‘N),

Part | 1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Amend ltem 9 Brooker Street: delete “26.1 metres” and substitute “21.5 metres”
and delete “2.3 metres” and substitute ‘3 metres”

Delete Item 17 Conway Street (east/west branch)

Add new Item 17: Conway Street (east/west section) — North side - from a point
28.2 metres east of the prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Conway Street
(north/south section) eastwards for a distance of 2.3 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Delete Item 18 Conway Street (east/west section)

Add new ltem 18: Conway Street (east/west section) — North side - from a point
138.8 metres east of the prolongation of the eastern kerbline of Conway Street
eastwards for a distance of 21.1 metres - (CPZ) “N”

Add new ltem 36a: Goldstone Street - East side - from a point 40.2 metres north of

the northern kerbline of Ellen Street northwards for a distance of 2 metres - (CPZ)
“N”

Delete Item 71 Tisbury Road

Add Item 71: Tisbury Road - west side - from a point 83.7 metres north of the

northern kerbline of Church Road northwards for a distance of 3 metres - (CPZ)
LLN”

Part 12.2 - Loading only 24 hours of any day (for up to a perlod of 30
minutes no return within | hour) residential roads

Add ltem 9a: Second Avenue — East side - from a point 18.] metres north of the
northern kerbline of Queens Gardens northwards for a distance of 7.8 metres -
(CPZ) “N”

Delete Item 12 Ventnor Villas

Part 12.3 Loading only 9am to 6pm Monday to Saturday (for up to a
period of 30 minutes, no return within | hour) commercial roads
Amend ltem 3 Church Road: delete” 16.5 metres” and substitute ““17.8 metres”

Amend ltem 7 Church Road: delete “22 metres” and substitute 12 metres” and
delete “west for a distance of 12 metres” and substitute “eastwards for a distance of
18.8 metres”

Add new ltem 9a: Church Road — North side - from a point 27 metres west of the
western kerbline of Salisbury Road westwards for a distance of 10 metres - (CPZ)
LLN’?



Part 12.4 Loading Only 9am to 8pm Monday to Sunday (for up to a period
of | hour, no return within 30 minutes)

Add ltem I: Ventnor Villas — West side - from a point |0 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Blatchington Road southwards for a distance of | | metres -
(CPZ) “N”

Part 12.12 Loading Only Monday to Sunday 8am to 6pm
Add Item I: Church Road - south side - from a point 10.4 metres east of the eastern
kerbline of Fourth Avenue eastwards for a distance of || metres - (CPZ) “N”

Part 18.1 ~ Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permit

Amend ltem 55 Sackville Road: in column (3) insert “but excluding No.105, Flats | to
7 No.41 and Ground floor north, Ground floor south, 1* Floor North, |* Floor
South & 2™ Floor No.43" after “Odd Nos. 1-157 only”. In column (4) insert “All
excluded properties are Car Free”

Amend Item 67 St John's Road: in column (3) insert “Excluding Flats 4, 5, 6, 7 & 8
Alpha House, | & 2 The Sands and Units |, 2, & 3 Beta House (also known as Units
1,2 & 3 Alpha House). In column (4) insert “All excluded properties are Car Free”

Amend‘ Item 74 Vallance Gardens: in column (3) insert “Excluding Flats | to 9 Nos.
[-3”. In column (4) insert “Flats | to 9 Nos. -3 (Car Free)”

Zone O

Part 4.2 Permit parking only from Monday to Saturday between 9am and
8pm inclusive

Amend ltem 6 Caister’s Close: delete “north side” and substitute “South and West
sides”

Amend Item 17 Davigdor Road: delete “Windlesham Road” and substitute
“Windlesham Gardens”

Amend Item 18 Davigdor Road: delete “Windlesham Road” and substitute
“Windlesham Gardens”

Amend Item 19 Davigdor Road: delete “Windlesham Road” and substitute
“Windlesham Gardens”

Part 5.5 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay and
Display parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, with no return within 4
hours) from Monday to Saturday between 9am to 8pm inclusive

Add ltem 9a: Davigdor Road — North side - from a point 10 metres west of the
western kerbline of Julian Road westwards for a distance of 6.1 metres = (CPZ) “O”

Add Item 9b: Davigdor Road — North side - from a point 22.3 metres west of the
western kerbline of Julian Road westwards for a distance of 10 metres = (CPZ) “O”



Add Item 9c: Davigdor Road — North side - from a point 39.5 metres west of the
western kerbline of Julian Road westwards for a distance of 4.3 metres - (CPZ) “O”

Add Item 9d: Davigdor Road — North side - from a point 71.8 metres west of the
western kerbline of Julian Road westwards for a distance of | | metres = (CPZ) “O”

Add Item 9e: Davigdor Road — North side - from a point 89.9 metres west of the
western kerbline of Julian Road westwards for a distance of 5.6 metres = (CPZ) “O”

Add Item 9f: Davigdor Road — North side - from a point 10! metres west of the
western kerbline of Julian Road westwards for a distance of 4 metres = (CPZ) “O”

Add Item 9g: Davigdor Road — North side - from a point || | metres west of the
western kerbline of Julian Road westwards for a distance of 8.7 metres = (CPZ) “O”

Delete existing Item |3 Goldsmid Road

Add new Item [3: Goldsmid Road — North side - from a point 13.6 metres east of

~ the eastern kerbline of Julian Road eastwards for a distance of | 1.6 metres = (CPZ)
“O”

Add Item |3a: Goldsmid Road — North side - from a point 28.1 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Julian Road eastwards for a distance of 46.5 metres = (CPZ) “O”

Add Item |13b: Goldsmid Road — North side - from a point 77.6 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Julian Road eastwards for a distance of 16.2 metres - (CPZ) “O”

Amend Item 22 Lorna Road: delete “Lorna Road” and substitute “Lyndhurst Road”
Amend ltem 36 Silverdale Avenue: delete “northwest” and substitute “northeast”

Part 5.10 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay &
Display parking (for a period up to | | hours) from Monday to Saturday
between 9am and 8pm inclusive

Amend Item |2 Palmeira Avenue: delete “12.5 metres south of the northern
boundary of No.32 Palmeira Avenue” and substitute “44.6 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Lansdowne Road”

Part 6.1 Exclusive Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for a
period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to
Saturday between 9am and 6pm inclusive

Delete Item 6 Lyndhurst Road

Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At any Time
Add Item 2: Palmeira Place — West side - from a point 9.9metres south of the

southern boundary of No.| Palmeira Place southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres -
(CPZ) “O"



Part 8.1 City Car Club only At Any Time

Add Item I: Montefiore Road - West side - from a point 54 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Lyndhurst Road southwards for a distance of 5.3 metres =
(CPZ) “O”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add Item |7a: Lyndhurst Road — South side - from a point 28.1 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Holland Road eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres = (CPZ)
“O”

Delete ltem 29 Wilbury Road

Part 11.1 - Motorcycles only At Any Time
Delete Item |3 Davigdor Road

Add new ltem 13: Davigdor Road — North side - from a point 86.9 metres west of
the western kerbline of Julian Road westwards for a distance of 3 metres - (CPZ)
L‘O)l

Delete Item 18 Goldsmid Road

Add new Item 18: Goldsmid Road — North side - from a point 8.6 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Julian Road eastwards for a distance of 5 metres - (CPZ) “O”

Delete ltem 47 Wilbury Avenue
Delete Item 48 Wilbury Avenue
Delete Item 49 Wilbury Avenue
Delete Item 50 Wilbury Avenue
Delete Item 51 Wilbury Avenue
Delete Item 52 Wilbury Avenue
Delete Item 53 Wilbury Avenue
Delete Item 54 Wilbury Avenue

Part 14.1 -Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Delete Item 3 Lyndhurst Road

Zone Q

Part 1.1 No Waiting At Any Time
Add ltem 3a: Chatham Place — Both sides - Whole length of the Road - (CPZ) “Q”



Add Item [2a: New England Road — Both sides - from the eastern kerbline of York
Grove to a point 46.5 metres north west of the north western kerbline of Argyle
Road - (CPZ) “Q”

Part 1.3 No Waiting Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm
Delete Item 3 York Villas

Part 1.4 No Waiting 9am to 6pm Monday to Saturday

Add Item la: Chatham Place — South east side - from the southern property
boundary of No.3 Chatham Place south westwards to a point 32 metres northeast
of the junction with Seven Dials - (CPZ) “Q”

Part 9.1- Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend ltem | Belmont: delete “25 metres” and substitute “28.8 metres”

Add ltem la: Belmont — South side - from a point 22.2 metres east of the eastern
kerbline of Dyke Road eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres = (CPZ) “Q”

Add ltem [7a: Parkmore Terrace — South side - from a point | metre west of the
property boundary of Nos. 14 & |5 Parkmore Terrace to a point 20 metres east for
a distance of 6.6 metres eastwards = (CPZ) “Q”

Add Item 23a: Stanford Road — West side - from a point 52.3 metres north of the

northern kerbline of Old Shoreham Road northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres -
(CPZ) “Q”

Part 12.5 Loading Only Monday -Saturday 8am to 6pm (up to a period of
30 minutes, no return within | hour)
Amend Item | Dyke Road: delete “25 metres” and substitute *20 metres”

Part 12.8 Loading Only Monday - Saturday 9am to épm (up to a period of
I hour, no return within | hour)

Add Item 5: York Villas — North side - from a point 18 metres west of the western
kerbline of York Grove westwards for a distance of 8.7 metres = (CPZ) “Q"

Part 18.1 Streets Eligible for a Resident’s Permit

Add numbers to the column headings as follows: Item No. “(1)”, Street Name “(2)”,
Specific Properties “(3)”, Comments “(4)”, CPZ “(5)”

Add Item 3a: Chatham Place - (CPZ) “Q”

Add Item 12a: New England Road — (Specific Properties) “Excluding Nos. 32 to 57
inclusive” — (Comments) “Nos. 32 to 57 (Car Free)” - (CPZ) “Q”

Zone R

Part 1.1 No Waiting At Any Time
Amend Item 14 Kingsway: delete “Sackville Gardens “and substitute “Langdale Road”

16



Delete Item 15 Kingsway

Delete Item 18 Lawrence Road

Delete Item 29 New Church Road

Amend Item 31 New Church Road: delete “From the junction with Sackville Road to
the junction of Langdale Road” and substitute “Between Hove Street and Langdale
Road”

Delete Item 32 New Church Road

Delete Item 37 Portland Road

Delete Item 45 Richardson Road

Delete Item 50 Sackville Road

Delete Item 52 Sackville Road

Delete Item 53 Sackville Road

Delete Item 67 Westbourne Street

Part 4.1 - Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am and
8pm inclusive

Amend Item 17 Kingsways: delete ‘“”’from a point 10 metres east of the eastern

kerbline of Carlisle Road” and substitute “from a point 13 metres east of the eastern
kerbline of Carlisle Road”

Amend ltem 29 Molesworth Street: delete “Tamworth Street” and substitute
“Tamworth Road”

Delete existing Item 55 Sheridan Terrace

Add new Item 55: Sheridan Terrace - North side - from a point 1.5 metres west of
the eastern boundary wall of no. 94 Sheridan Terrace westwards to a point 4 metres
east of the western boundary wall of No.18 Sheridan Terrace - (CPZ) “R”

Add Item 55a: Sheridan Terrace — Eastern Arm East side - from a point 0.3 metres
south of the northern boundary wall of Woods House southwards to a point | 1.5
metres north of the northern kerbline of Coleridge Street = (CPZ) “R”

Part 5.1 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Short Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours) from
Monday to Sunday between 9am to 8pm inclusive

‘Amend ltem 6 Langdale Road: delete “Langdale Road” and substitute “New Church
Road”.



Part 5.4 - Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay &
Display parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours)
fromm Monday to Sunday between 9am -8pm inclusive

Amend Item 27 New Church Road: delete “easterly boundary of property No.67”
and substitute “prolongation of the easterly boundary of property No.67”

Amend ltem 53 Stoneham Road: delete “ No.7” and substitute “No.80 (unit 7)”
Amend ltem 58 Westbourne Gardens: delete “18 metres” substitute “22.5 metres”

Amend ltem 65 Westbourne Villas: delete “24.5 metres” and substitute “30.5
metres”

Part 7.1- Doctors Parking At Any Time
Delete Item 2 Eaton Gardens

y

Amend ltem 3 Westbourne Gardens: delete “21 metres” and substitute “27 metres’

Part 8.1 City Car Club only At Any Time
Amend ltem | Landseer Road: delete “6 metres” and substitute “14 metres”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add Item 9a: Carlisle Road — East side - from the prolongation of the southern
boundary of No.27 northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ) “R”

Add Item |5a: Kingsthorpe Road — South side - from a point 30.5 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Grange Road eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ) “R”

Add Item 39a: Modena Road — West side - from a point 48 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Lawrence Road northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres =

(CPZ) “R”

Amend ltem |8 Landseer Road: delete “North” and substitute “North” and delete *
kerbline” and substitute “boundary”.

Delete Item 38 Milnthorpe Road

Amend ltem 46 Mortimer Road: delete “prolongation of the boundary” and
substitute “prolongation of the western boundary”

Add Item 6éla: Poynter Road — North side - from a point 8.9 metres west of the
western kerbline of Sackville Road westwards for a distance of 6.6 metres = (CPZ)
llR”

Delete Item 81 Shelley Road

Amend Item 75 Sackville Road: delete “30/31” and substitute *30/32”

Delete Item 94 Westbourne Gardens



Delete Item 95 Westbourne Gardens

Amend Item 96 Westbourne Gardens: delete “From the common boundary of Nos.
42 and 44" and substitute “From a point 3.2 metres north of the southern boundary
of No.42” delete “southwards” and substitute “northwards”

Add ltem 96a: Westbourne Gardens — West side - from a point 0.8 metres north of
the southern boundary wall of No.22 Westbourne Gardens northwards for a
distance of 6.6 metres = (CPZ) “R”

Delete ltem 99 Westbourne Street

Add Item 100a: Westbourne Street — East side - from the northern boundary of
No.29 Westbourne Street southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ) “R”

Delete Item 101 Westbourne Street

Add new Item 104a: Westbourne Villas — West side - from a point 41.5 metres
south of the southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of
7.5 metres = (CPZ) “R”

Add ltem I 10A: Wordsworth Street — South side - from a point 81.7 metres east of

the eastern kerbline of Westbourne Street eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres =
(CPZ) l(R’7

Part 1 1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Amend Item |7 Landseer Road: delete “6m" and substitute “1 | metres”

Amend Item 20 Leighton Road: delete “Firth Road for” and substitute “Firth Road
southwards for”

Add ltem 28a: Montgomery Street — North side - from a point 41.8 metres west of
the western kerbline of St Patrick’s Road westwards for a distance of 3 metres =

(CPZ) “R”

Amend Item 56 Tamworth Road: delete “Portland Road for” and substitute
“Portland Road northwards for”

Delete Item 58 Westbourne Gardens

Amend Item 60 Westbourne Gardens: delete “18 metres” and substitute “22.5
metres” and delete “3 metres” and substitute “4.5 metres”

Amend Item 64 Westbourne Place: delete “North side” and substitute “South side”

Amend Item 67 Westbourne Street: delete “Arthur Street for’” and substitute
“Arthur Street southwards for”



Amend ltem 70 Wordsworth Street; delete “Rutland Road for” and substitute
“Rutland Road eastwards for”

Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Amend ltem 2 Pembroke Crescent: delete “Nos. 26 and 27" and substitute “Nos. 27
and 29"

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permit
Add numbers to the column headings as follows: Item No. “(1)”, Street Name “(2)”,
Specific Properties “(3)”, Comments “(4)”, CPZ “(5)"

Amend ltem 13 Kingsway: in column (3) delete “Sackville Gardens” and substitute
“Langdale Road”

Amend Item 27 New Church Road: in column (3) delete “East of its junction with
Rutland Gardens only” and substitute “North side east of its junction with
Richardson Road only and excluding Flats 1to 10 No.50 & Flats Ito 15 No.52". In
column (4) insert “Flats 1to 10 No.50 & Flats Ito |5 No.52 (Car Free)”

Add Item 27a: New Church Road — (Specific Properties) South side east of its
junction with Langdale Road only = (CPZ) “R”

Amend ltem 32 Portland Road: in column (3) delete “From Sackville Road to
Hogarth Road Only” and substitute “North side Between Sackville Road and
Bolsover Road only”

Amend ltem 33 Portland Road: in column (3) delete “Between School Road and
Coleman Avenue only” and substitute “South side Between Sackville Road and
Coleman Avenue only”

Amend Item 43 Sackville Gardens: in column (3) insert “Excluding No.61 and Flats |
to 5 No.63”. In column (4) insert “No.61 and Flats | to 5 No.63 (Car Free)”

Amend ltem 61 Westbourne Villas: in column (3) insert “Excluding No.29”. In
column (4) insert “No.29 (Car Free)”

Zone T

Part 1.1 No Waiting At Any Time

Amend Item 8 Wilbury Avenue: delete “Whole length of the road” and substitute
“Between its junction with The Drive and Hove Park Villas”

Part 4.1 - Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am and

8pm inclusive
Amend item | Fonthill Road: delete “7.1 metres” and substitute “[4 metres”

20



Zone U
Part 9.1- Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Amend Item |1 Sutherland Road: delete ““32.5 metres” and substitute “30.2 metres”
and delete “6.6 metres” and substitute “5.5 metres”’.

Zone W

Part I.1 No waiting At Any Time
Delete Item 6 Kingsway

Amend Item 9 Lawrence Road: delete “North side” and substitute “Both sides” and
delete “From the junction of Rutland Gardens to the junction of Richardson Road”
and substitute “VWhole Length”.

Delete item 10 Lawrence Road

Amend Item 14 New Church Road: delete “Rutland Gardens” and substitute
“Sackville Gardens.”

Part 4.6 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 10-1am
and 7-8pm inclusive

Amend Item 20 Raphael Road: delete “New Church Road” and substitute “Lawrence
Road”

Amend ltem 21 Raphael Road: delete “New Church Road” and substitute “Lawrence
Road”

Amend Item 22 Reynolds Road: delete “New Church Road” and substitute
“Lawrence Road”

Amend ltem 23 Reynolds Road: delete “New Church Road” and substitute
“Lawrence Road”

Amend ltem 28 Titian Road delete: “New Church Road” and substitute “Lawrence
Road”

Amend ltem 29 Titian Road delete: “New Church Road” and substitute “Lawrence
Road”

Part 9.1 - Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete Item | Berriedale Avenue

Delete Item 6 Langdale Gardens

Amend ltem || Lawrence Road: insert “eastwards” after “Reynolds Road” and
before “for a distance”.

Delete ltem 12 Lawrence Road

21



Amend ltem 13 New Church Road: delete “Avenue” and substitute “Crescent”
Delete Item 15 Raphael Road

Add Item 2la: Wish Road — East side - from a point 83.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of New Church Road southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres -

(CPZ) “W”

Part 1.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Amend ltem 9 Lawrence Road: delete “Hogarth” and substitute “Hogarth”

Delete Item |5 St Helier’s Avenue
Zone Y

Part [.1- No Waiting At Any Time
Delete Item 16 Chatham Place

Amend item 19 Church Street: delete “Whole Length” and substitute “West of the
junction with Queens Road”

Delete ltem 58 New England Road

Add new ltem 62a: Oxford Court — West side - from the southern kerbline of
Oxford Street southwards for a distance of 22.3 metres - (CPZ) “Y”

Add new ltem 62b: Oxford Court — East side - from the southern kerbline of
Oxford Street southwards for a distance of 19.6 metres - (CPZ) “Y”

Part 1.3 No Waiting Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm
Add ltem |: Sydney Street — East side - from the southern property boundary of no.
47 Sydney Street, northwards for a distance of 20 metres - (CPZ) “Y”

Add Item 2: Sydney Street — West side - from a point opposite the northern
kerbline of Gloucester Street, northwards for a distance of |13 metres - (CPZ) “Y”

Add Item 3: Sydney Street — West side - from a point 3 metres north of the
northern property boundary of no. 15 Sydney Street, southwards for a distance of
16 metres - (CPZ) “Y”

Add Item 4: Sydney Street — West side - from a point 20 metres south of the

southern kerbline of Trafalgar Street, southwards for a distance of 16 metres -
(CPZ) uYn

Part 1.4 -No Waiting Monday to Saturday 9am to é6pm
Delete Item | Chatham Place

22



Add Item 5a: Compton Avenue — Southeast side - from the common boundary
between Nos. 38 and 40 Compton Avenue north eastwards for a distance of 8.7
metres - (CPZ) “Y”

Add Item 16a: North Road — South side - from a point 12.2 metres west of the
western kerbline of Queens Road westwards for a distance of 10.3 metres - (CPZ)
uYn

Delete ltem 25 Sydney Street
Delete Item 26 Sydney Street
Delete Item 27 Sydney Street
Delete Item 28 Sydney Street

Part 2.1 No Loading At any Time
Delete ltem 2 Bath Street

Add new Item 18a: Oxford Court — East side - from the southern kerbline of
Oxford Street southwards for a distance of 19.6 metres - (CPZ) “Y”

Part 3.1 No stopping Monday to Friday 8am-9.30am and 2.30-4pm on
School Entrance Markings

Amend Item | Ann Street: delete “9.8 meters east of the eastern kerbline of New
England Street, eastwards for 31.56 metres.” and substitute “2.7 metres west of the
western kerbline of Providence Place westwards for a distance of 43.5 metres”

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am and
8pm inclusive

Amend Item |7 Bath Street: delete “From the” and substitute “From a point 4.2
metres northeast of the” and delete “63 metres” and substitute “67.2 metres”

Part 5.15 Shared Permit Holders and Medium Tariff Medium Term Pay &
Display parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours)
from Monday to Sunday between 9am to 8pm

Amend Item 7 Bath Street: delete “20 metres” and substitute “23.5 metres”

Part 5.18 Shared Permit Holders and High Tariff Short Term Pay &
Display parking (for a period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours)
from Monday to Sunday between 9am to 8pm inclusive

Add ltem la: Foundry Street — West side - from the northern boundary wall of
No.37 Foundry Street northwards for a distance of 15 metres - (CPZ) *Y”

Part 8.1 = City Car Club only At Any Time
Add ltem la: Foundry Street - West side - from a point 9.5 metres south of the

southern kerbline of Gloucester Road southwards for a distance of 5 metres - (CPZ)
l‘Y?)

23



Add ltem 3a: West Hill Road - North side - from a point 4.5 metres west of the

western kerbline of Buckingham Road westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres -
(CPZ) EIY”

Part 8.3 Streetcar Car Club only At Any Time
Add ltem |: Leopold Road — South side - from a point 27.2 metres west of the
western kerbline of Buckingham Road westwards for a distance of 5.5 metres.

Permit No.3-005

Add ltem 2: Montpelier Crescent — West side - from a point 30.4 metres south of
the southern kerbline of Vernon Terrace southwards for a distance of 5.5 metres.
Permit No.3-006

Part 9.1- Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add ltem la: Alexandra Villas — West side - from a point 25.1 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Albert Road southwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ)

uYn
Amend ltem 26 Queens Gardens: delete “6 metres” and substitute “7.8 metres”

Add Item 48a: West Hill Road — South side - from a point 73.7 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Dyke Road eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ) *Y”

Part 18.1 Streets Eligible for Parking Permits
Delete Item 21 Chatham Place

Delete Iltem 75 New England Road

Amend ltem 107 St Nicholas Road: in column (3) insert “Excluding No.44. In
column (4) insert No.44 (Car Free)”

Zone Z

Part 1.1 -No Waiting At Any Time
Amend Item 34 Kings Road: delete “Whole length” and substitute “From Grand
Junction Road to East Street”

Add Item 100: Zion Gardens — Both sides — Whole Length and across the southern
junction with Air Street - (CPZ) “Z”

Part 2.1 No Loading At any Time
Amend Item 31 St Margaret’s Place: delete “Both sides” and substitute “North and
West sides”

Add ltem 31a: St Margaret’s Place — South side - from the prolongation of the

kerbline adjoining No.6 St Margaret’s Place eastwards to the junction of Cannon
Place - (CPZ) “Z”

24



Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am and
8pm inclusive

Add Item 7a: Bedford Square - North side (southern end) - from a point 2 metres
east of the western boundary of Bedford Square, eastwards for a distance of 5.2
metres - (CPZ) “Z”

Amend Item 27 Clifton Place: delete “47 metres” and substitute “46 metres”

Add Item [ 12a: Victoria Street — East side - from a point 8.8 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Victoria Road to the prolongation of the southern kerbline of
Victoria Place - (CPZ) “Z”

Add Item |12b: Victoria Street — East side - from a point 9.9 metres south of the
prolongation of the southern kerbline of Victoria Place southwards for a distance of
39 metres - (CPZ) “Z”

Part 5.15 -Shared Permit Holders and Medium Tariff Medium Term Pay
and Display parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4
hours) from Monday to Sunday between 9am and 8pm

Amend Item 2 Clifton Place: delete “east” and substitute “west” and delete “32
metres” and substitute “36 metres”

Part 5.18 -Shared Permit Holders and Pay and Display High Tariff Short
Term parking (for a period of up to 2 hours, no return within 4 hours)
from Monday to Sunday between 9am and 8pm inclusive

Amend Item 7 Castle Street: insert “9.2 metres” after “for a distance of’

Amend Item 8 Middle Street: delete “2 metres” and substitute “5 metres” and delete
“23 metres” and substitute “1 | metres”

Part 7.1- Doctors Parking At Any Time

Add Item |: Windsor Street — East side - from a point 25.2 metres north of the
northern kerbline of North Street northwards for a distance of || metres - (CPZ)
“Z"

Part 8.1 - City Car Club only At Any Time

Add Item 4: Clarence Square — North side - from a point |8 metres east of the
prolongation of the western kerbline of the western arm of Clarence Square
eastwards for a distance of 5.5 metres - (CPZ) “Z”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add Item |6a: Montpelier Terrace — North side - from a point 22 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Montpelier Road eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres - (CPZ)
ELZ’!

Delete Item 17 New Road

25



Part 9.2 -Disabled Badge Holders Parking Monday to Sunday between
9am and 6pm
Delete Item 5 Hampton Place

Delete Item 10 Regency Square

Part 9.4 - Disabled Badge Holders Parking Places Maximum Length of
Stay 3 hours no return within | hour

Add ltem 2: New Road — West side - From a point 41.5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Church Street southwards for a distance of 27 metres - (CPZ)
g

Part 11.1 Motorcycles only At Any Time
Delete existing Item 4 Bedford Square

Add new Item 4: Bedford Square — South side (northern end) - from a point 8
metres west of the eastern boundary fence of Bedford Square, westwards for a
distance of 5 metres - (CPZ) “Z”

Part 12.1 Loading Bay At Any Time
Add ltem la: Bedford Place — West side - from a point 9 metres south of the

southern kerbline of Western Road southwards for a distance of 8.6 metres - (CPZ)
l‘Zi’

Delete Item 28 Regency Square

Delete Item 29 Regency Square

Delete Item 30 Regency Square

Delete Item 3| Regency Square

Add Item 33a: St Margaret’s Place — South side - from the prolongation of the
kerbline adjoining No.6 St Margaret’s Place westwards for a distance of 8.8 metres -
(CPZ) “Z”

Part 12.11 Loading Only Monday to Sunday 9am to épm

Add ltem |: Regency Square — East side - from a point adjacent to the property
boundary of nos. 56/57 Regency Square, northwards for a distance of |2metres -
(CPZ) “Z”

Add Item 2: Regency Square — North side - from a point adjacent to the property
boundary of nos. 27/28 Regency Square, eastwards for a distance of 12metres -
(CPZ) *“ZL”

Add Item 3: Regency Square —West side - from a point adjacent to the southern

property boundary of no. 4 Regency Square, northwards to a point adjacent to the
northern property boundary of no. 4 Regency Square - (CPZ) “Z”

26



Add ltem 4: Regency Square — West side - from a point 4 metres south of the

southern property boundary of no. 14 Regency Square, northwards for a distance of
2metres - (CPZ) “Z”

Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Delete Item | Bedford Place

e

Part 18.1 Streets Eligible for a Resident’s Permit
Amend ltem 64 Little Preston Street: in column (3) insert “Excluding Nos. | 1A &
[1B. In column (4) insert “Nos. | |A & 1B (Car Free)”

Amend Item 71 Middle Street: in column (3) insert “and No.27 and Flats | & 2
No.27A" after “Excluding Nos. 20-23". In column (4) insert “and No.27 and Flats |
& 2 No.27A” before “(Car Free)”

The Brighton & Hove (Various Roads in Brighton & Hove) (Disabled
Persons’ Parking Places) No.2 Order 1998

Schedule - Disabled Persons Parking Places

Revoke Item 6: 5 Buckingham Road (outside), Brighton

THE COMMON SEAL OF BRIGHTON
& HOVE CITY COUNCIL was affixed this

29" day of Ocrobber  Two Thousand and Nine
in the presence of

p g

Authorised Person

27



